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ENFORCEMENT CORNER

Cosmetic producers beware. Despite some who say  
that no one cares whether cosmetic products meet 
regulatory requirements, you may be the subject of an 

enforcement action. While the Food and Drug Administration 
(FDA) undoubtedly takes fewer enforcement actions against 
cosmetic companies and products than it does against compa-
nies selling foods, drugs or devices, FDA and others actively 
enforce legal requirements concerning cosmetics.

FDA Enforcement
Some believe that the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act 

(FDCA) would more appropriately be called the Federal Food 
and Drug Act. They would be wrong. The FDCA prohibits 
selling adulterated and misbranded cosmetics.1 Among other 
things, a cosmetic is adulterated if it bears an unsafe color ad-
ditive or contains a poisonous or deleterious substance which 
may render it injurious to users.2 Misbranded cosmetics include 
those that have false or misleading labeling or labeling that 
does not contain all required information.3 FDA also regulates 
cosmetics under the Fair Packaging and Labeling Act (FPLA).4 
FDA’s Center for Food Safety and Applied Nutrition (CFSAN) 
has primary responsibility for FDA’s regulation of cosmetics.

FDA has a variety of tools for enforcing cosmetics’ legal 
requirements, including issuing warning letters and asking the 
Department of Justice to initiate a seizure action.5 FDA does not 
issue warning letters simply as a public reprimand. Rather, such 
letters should be viewed as a warning of more significant FDA 
enforcement action should the recipient not adequately address 
the agency’s concerns. If a cosmetic is unsafe, FDA encourages 
cosmetic companies to recall the product.6 FDA’s enforcement 
of cosmetics’ requirements is probably most active at the na-
tion’s borders, where products are often refused or detained. 
FDA has rarely initiated seizure, injunction or criminal pros-
ecution for violations of cosmetic product legal requirements.

Instead, FDA is much more likely to use the warning letter 

enforcement tool against cosmetic-like products. For example, 
FDA has sent warning letters in which the agency found hair 
removal kits to be medical devices and anti-wrinkle skin 
creams to be drugs.7 Indeed, the issue of drugs purportedly 
masquerading as cosmetics is significant enough that CFSAN 
and FDA’s Center for Drug Evaluation and Research (CDER) 
have a Memorandum of Understanding on the topic.8

One interesting example of FDA’s cosmetics enforcement is 
the saga of decorative contact lenses. The story begins with the 
Center for Devices and Radiological Health (CDRH) inform-
ing a company that decorative contact lenses were prescription 
medical devices, not cosmetics. In a decision that was contro-
versial in both FDA and Congress, FDA’s then Chief Counsel 
determined that these lenses were cosmetics. However, FDA 
effectively prohibited the marketing of such products when 
FDA identified allegedly serious safety concerns with the 
contact lenses and required companies that intended to market 
these lenses first “demonstrate to FDA that the product is safe 
and properly labeled.”9 FDA also issued an Import Alert calling 
for the detention without physical examination of decorative 
contact lenses and a press release warning consumers about 
decorative contact lenses.10 FDA actively enforced its position 
that decorative contact lenses were cosmetics until late 2005 
when Congress enacted a law that made all contact lenses  
medical devices.11

One of the nation’s most active cosmetics enforcement groups 
is not a government agency, but an industry self-regulation 
group. The Council of Better Business Bureau’s National Adver-
tising Division (NAD) investigates the veracity of advertising, 
including cosmetics advertising. If NAD finds a claim is not 
adequately supported by competent and reliable evidence, it will 
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recommend that the subject company modify or discontinue 
the claim. For instance, in December 2007, NAD recommended 
that Preval modify or discontinue certain claims for its Acti-
Fade Complete Age-Defying System because NAD found that 
the product’s claims overstated the product’s effectiveness.12

If a company does not participate in NAD’s investigation or 
disregards NAD’s recommendations, NAD will typically refer 
the case to the Federal Trade Commission (FTC). The FTC’s 
Division of Advertising Practices “protects consumers from 
unfair or deceptive advertising and marketing practices that 
raise health and safety concerns, as well as those that cause 
economic injury.”13 The FTC takes quite seriously any NAD 
referral.14 The FTC prioritizes cases by often focusing first on 
whether a product raises any safety concerns. The FTC has 
taken action against companies that made cosmetic claims for 
cosmetic-like products, such as “cosmeceuticals.” For example, 
in 2003, Rexall Sundown had to pay $12 million to settle an 
FTC case and class action for Rexall’s marketing of Cellasene, 
a pill Rexall claimed could “eliminate cellulite.”15 NAD has also 
referred some matters to FDA.

State Enforcement
Many states have long had laws prohibiting the market-

ing of adulterated or misbranded cosmetics. These laws often 
closely mirror the language of the FDCA.16 However, there is a 
small, but growing trend of states tightening their regulation of 
cosmetic products. For instance, while the California Attorney 
General found that levels of lead in lipstick did not warrant 
action under Prop 65, the Attorney General did file suit against 
a handful of companies that market natural personal care prod-
ucts containing 1, 4-dioxane.17

Future Areas for Enforcement
A number of state legislatures have recently considered bills 

that would prohibit or require labeling disclosure of cosmet-
ics’ ingredients. In 2006, California enacted the California Safe 
Cosmetics Act, which requires a cosmetic manufacturer to no-
tify the state of any ingredient in a cosmetic product that is on 
California’s or a specified “authoritative body’s” list of chemi-
cals that cause cancer or reproductive toxicity.18 In Massachu-
setts, one pending bill would temporarily require companies 
to disclose to its Department of Health any cosmetic product 
containing an ingredient deemed unsafe by FDA or the Per-
sonal Care Products Council’s Cosmetic Ingredient Review.19 If 
the bill is enacted, cosmetics containing such ingredients would 
be per se adulterated or misbranded two years after the bill’s 
enactment. Another pending Massachusetts bill would require 
companies to phase in alternatives to 10 chemicals currently 

found in cosmetics, including lead and di-(2-ethylhexyl)phtha-
late.20 Minnesota recently enacted a law prohibiting consumer 
products from containing mercury.21

Back in Congress, Representative John Dingell (D-MI) has 
circulated a draft of the Food and Drug Administration Glo-
balization Act of 2008.22 If enacted, the bill would require all 
cosmetic companies to register with FDA, to report all adverse 
events to FDA and to comply with good manufacturing  
practices to be established by regulation. 
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